ARD&H Adelberg, Rudow, Dorf & Hendler: Lic

Attorneys At Law

Richard Anthony Calice, Jr.
43 Winterberry Court
Cockeysville, MD 21030

410.539.5195
410.539.5834 fax

www.AdelbergRudow.com

7 Saint Paul Street | Suite 600
Baltimore, Maryland 21202-1612

November 7, 2012
ID: 13371
Invoice No: 111401

PERSONAL AND CONFIDENTIAL

Total feesthisinvoice
Total disbursementsthisinvoice

Total amount this invoice

Balance forward

Total amount due

Summary page
Pleaseretain for your records

$7,489.00
99.43
$7,588.43
$0.00
$7,588.43
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' | l l l 7 Saint Paul Street | Suite 600
Baltimore, Maryland 21202-1612
Calice, Jr., Richard Anthony November 7, 2012
Client #: 13371

Invoice#: 111401

M atter Recap of Current | nvoice

Re: 13371.00300 Custody

Fees for Professiona Services: $7,489.00
Costs. 99.43
Matter Total: $7,588.43
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Calice, Jr., Richard Anthony November 7, 2012
Client #: 13371

Invoice#: 111401

Client Matter 1D: 13371.00300
RE: Custody

For Professional Services Rendered Through: OCTOBER 31, 2012

Date Initials Description Hours

10/01/12 CGC Reviewing and revising Amended Complaint; emailing same to F.K. 0.30
Kolodner for review

10/01/12 FKK Reviewing and revising A. Calice's Amended Complaint; reading emails 1.00
from A. Calice

10/02/12 CGC Received and reviewed F.K. Kolodner's suggested changes to Amended 2.00
Complaint; reviewing and revising Amended Complaint; received and
reviewed multiple emails from A. Calice regarding evidence; emailing A.
Cdlice in response to same; received and reviewed voice mail from A.
Calice; emailing draft Amended Complaint and blank financial statement
to A. Calicefor review and input

10/02/12 FKK Reviewing and revising Amended Complaint for Limited Divorce, etc,; 1.00
reading T. Calice's email messages
10/03/12 CGC Received and reviewed email from A. Calice with suggested changes to 0.30

Amended Complaint; reviewing and revising Amended Complaint;
emailing A. Calice revised Amended Complaint

10/03/12 FKK Reviewing T. Calice's Amended Complaint for Divorce, etc. 0.30

10/04/12 CGC Received and reviewed emails from T. Calice; emailing T. Calice in 0.70
response; received and reviewed email from Tom Demetriou, Esg. with
attached Pleadings filed by opposing counsel in Michigan; received and
reviewed email from T. Calice with attached documents evidencing
income; telephone conference with T. Calice; received and reviewed voice
mail from Tom Demetriou, Esq.

10/04/12 FKK Reading T. Calice's email messages,; emailing T. Calice 0.20

10/05/12 CGC Telephone conference with Tom Demetriou, Esg.; hand filing Amended 0.70
Complaint for Limited Divorce

10/05/12 FKK Reading Moation to Dismiss filed on 10/3/12 by Melissa Calice; emailing 0.80
to T. Cdiceand T. Demetriou, Esq.

10/06/12 FKK Reading email 0.10

10/08/12 CGC Telephone conference with Tom Demetriou, Esq.; received and reviewed 1.30
email with attached character reference letters; reviewing Pleadings filed
by wife in both Michigan and Maryland
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Date Initials Description Hours

10/09/12 CGC Telephone conference with M.B. Noren regarding UCCJEA issues, 4.00
meeting with F.K. Kolodner regarding same; telephoning Circuit Court for
Baltimore County Family Law Administrator, Richard Abbott, left
message; telephoning Judge Turnbull's (administrative judge) chambers,
spoke with his assistant; telephoning Judge Martin's chamber, left detailed
message regarding UCCJEA issue; telephone conference with T. Calice;
received and reviewed email from T. Calice setting forth plan going
forward; drafting Opposition to Motion to Dismiss; telephone conference
with Richard Abbott in the Circuit Court for Baltimore County; drafting
letter to Richard Abbott; gathering Michigan Pleadings to copy for the
Batimore County Circuit Court; telephone conference with Tom
Demetriou, Esq.

10/09/12 FKK Reviewing and revising letter to family law administrator, Richard Abbott, 0.60
about the need for two judges (Maryland and Michigan) to confer as to
jurisdictional issues; reading email messages; discussing with C.G. Cooper

10/09/12 FKK Reading T. Calice's email 0.10

10/10/12 CGC Received and reviewed emails from John Mills, Esq.; reviewing and 5.10
revising letter to Richard Abbott; drafting Opposition to Motion to
Dismiss; telephone conference with Judge Martin's law clerk (Christina);
emailing draft Motion to Dismiss to T. Calice for review; telephone
conferences with T. Calice; received and reviewed emails from T. Calice
and R. Calice; reviewing and revising Opposition to Motion to Dismiss

10/10/12 FKK Reviewing and revising T. Calice's Opposition to Motion to Dismiss filed 1.30
by Melissa Calice; telephone call with Tom Demetriou, attorney in
Michigan; telephone call with T. Calice; reviewing letter to Richard
Abbott (Family Law Coordinator in Baltimore County Court); reading
email from T. Calice

10/11/12 CGC Traveling to and from the Circuit Court for Baltimore County; filing 1.10
Opposition; hand delivering letter to Richard Abbott; hand delivering copy
of letter and Michigan and Maryland Pleadings to Judge Martin's
chambers; received and reviewed email from Susan Elgin, Esg.; emailing
Susan Elgin, Esqg. in response

10/15/12 CGC Received and reviewed email from Tom Demetriou, Esg. with attached 0.10
signed Order

10/16/12 CGC Received and reviewed email from Tom Demetriou, Esg.; telephoning 0.20
family law administrator in the Circuit Court for Baltimore County;
telephoning Judge Martin's secretary; emailing Tom Demetriou, Esq. with
status update

10/16/12 FKK Reading email messages 0.10
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10/17/12 CGC Received and reviewed emails from Tom Demetriou, Esq., F.K. Kolodner 0.10
and T. Calice

10/17/12 FKK Telephone cal from Judge Timothy Martin's secretary scheduling 0.40
conference call for 2:00 p.m. Thursday between Judges as to jurisdictional
issue, and inviting lawyers to attend (but not participate) in chambers;
emailing T. Calice and Tom Demetriou, Esqg.

10/18/12 CGC Received and reviewed emails from Tom Demetriou, Esq. and F.K. 0.50
Kolodner; emailing F.K. Kolodner; received and reviewed voice mail
messages from F.K. Kolodner; meeting with F.K. Kolodner; reviewing
Maryland Rules; drafting letter to T. Calice regarding "post-trial" remedies

10/18/12 FKK Preparing for conference call between judges, reviewing documents; 250
attending phone conference in Judge Martin's chambers and arguing that
Maryland had jurisdiction; telephone call with T. Calice following adverse
ruling; revising letter to T. Calice advising of his"post trial" remedies

10/19/12 FKK Reviewing and revising C.G. Cooper's "post-trial remedies’ letter to T. 0.20
Cdlice so that he knows his rights

TOTAL HOURS 25.00
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ARD&H Adelberg, Rudow, Dorf & Hendler; LL¢

Attorneys At Law

Calice, Jr., Richard Anthony

Client #: 13371

Invoice#: 111401

410.539.5195
410.539.5834 fax
www.AdelbergRudow.com

7 Saint Paul Street | Suite 600
Baltimore, Maryland 21202-1612

November 7, 2012

TIME AND FEE SUMMARY

TIMEKEEPER RATE HOURS AMOUNT
C.G. Cooper 260.00 16.40 $4,264.00
F.K. Kolodner 375.00 8.60 $3,225.00
TOTALS 25.00 $7,489.00
DISBURSEMENTS
Date Description Amount
10/31/12 Duplicating $52.00
10/31/12 Postage $3.00
10/31/12 Westlaw - Computer Research $44.43
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $99.43
TOTAL AMOUNT OF THISBILL $7,588.43
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE $7,588.43

BB& T Attorney Escrow Activity

Date

Beginning Balance
10/15/12

Ending Balance

Type

Write
Check

Payor/Payee Check # Description
ARD&H,LLC- 25557 Payment of fees & costs
Regular Acct
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Amount

$314.10
-314.10

$0.00
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Calice, Jr., Richard Anthony
Client #: 13371
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Attorneys At Law

410.539.5195
410.539.5834 fax
www.AdelbergRudow.com

7 Saint Paul Street | Suite 600
Baltimore, Maryland 21202-1612

November 7, 2012

PERSONAL AND CONFIDENTIAL

Total feesthisinvoice
Total disbursements thisinvoice

Total amount thisinvoice

Balance forward

Total amount due

Remittance copy
Please return with payment
Toensureproper credit to your account

$7,489.00
99.43
$7,588.43
$0.00
$7,588.43



